
Warwick A

 

red th
(ELF)
Altho
affect

Every
and a
cellph
transm
globa

As we
natur
to wh
sourc
fairly 
centu

Our h
stand
MRI 

W

Associates (70

E

 

hat w
(EM
This

hrough violet
) waves, radi

ough we cann
t our minds a

y living creatu
artificial sourc
hone base sta
mitters. Natu
al lightning ac

e continue to
ral sources of 
hich we are sy
ces of EM rad

new develop
ury with the e

harnessing of
dard of living 

machines, re

W 

07) 939-9212 

Ar

Electro
Di

 

we perceive w
M) spectrum, 

s tiny portion
t. Making up
o waves, mic
not see these 
and bodies in

ure on the pl
ces. Commo

ations, power
ural sources i
ctivity. 

o “electrify” t
f EM radiatio
ynchronized 
diation. We s
pment in the 
establishmen

f electricity is
in ways our 

efrigerators, a

www.warwic

rtic

Stra
omagn
imens

By Loui
(14

with our eyes
the range of

n of the EM 
p the remaind
crowaves, infr
energies, the

n profound w

lanet is imme
n sources of 

r lines, electri
include the e

the planet at 
on that have b
biologically 

seem to forge
history of hu
t of power st

s a double-ed
ancestors wo

and bomb di

ckassociates.c

cle

ange 
netic 
sions 

is Proud 
424 words) 

s is less than 
f wavelengths
spectrum, ca
der of the spe
frared, ultravi
ey are an ever
ways. 

ersed in a sea
artificial EM
ical appliance
arth’s magne

an alarming 
been present
are gradually
et that the us
umanity, hav
tations and el

dged sword. O
ould never ha
sposal robots

com 18340 S

one percent 
s over which 
alled visible li
ectrum are ex
iolet, X-rays,
r-present par

a of EM radia
M radiation in

es in the hom
etic field and 

rate through
t throughout 
y being drow
se of electrici
ving only rea
lectricity grid

On the one h
ave dreamed 
s—all of thes

Sonoma Hwy, 

of the electro
EM radiatio
ight, consists
xtremely low
, and gamma
rt of our envi

ation from b
nclude cellph
me, and TV a
d ELF waves g

h technologic
our entire ev

wned out by a
ty on a large

ally started in
ds. 

hand, it’s imp
possible. Co

se devices req

Sonoma CA 

omagnetic 
n extends. 
s of the color

w frequency 
a rays. 
ironment and

oth natural 
hones and 
and radio 
generated by

cal means, 
volution and
artificial 
-scale is a 

n the 20th 

proved our 
omputers, 
quire 

95476 

rs 

d 

y 

d 



Article: Strange Electromagnetic Dimensions by Louis Proud © 2014 

Warwick Associates (707) 939‐9212 www.warwickassociates.com 18340 Sonoma Hwy, Sonoma CA 95476 

electricity to operate. On the other hand, there are numerous health issues to consider. 

The World Health Organization (WHO) remains adamant in its position that “to date there 
is no evidence to conclude that exposure to low level [non-ionizing] electromagnetic fields is 
harmful to human health.” And yet an abundance of scientific research argues otherwise, 
some of it dating back more than half a century. Studies have revealed a connection between 
exposure to EM fields and such health problems as brain cancer, leukemia, and depression. 

There’s compelling evidence that such exposure suppresses production of the hormone 
melatonin by the pineal gland, resulting in disruption of the sleep-wake cycle and an 
increased risk of developing certain cancers. There’s evidence, too, that EM field exposure 
can induce in the body a state of chronic stress, which in turn compromises the efficiency of 
the immune system and increases one’s susceptibility to illness. 

Radar, which uses beams of pulsed microwaves to “sense” distant objects, was developed to 
perfection during the Second World War. In the years following the War, the finding 
emerged that radar operators have a tendency to suffer from health problems that include 
internal bleeding, leukemia, jaundice, cataracts, headaches, brain tumors, and heart 
conditions. Although it’s true that microwaves, which belong to the radio frequency (RF) 
portion of the EM spectrum, can heat and therefore damage bodily tissue, the adverse health 
effects experienced by the radar operators were non-thermal in origin. 

In the 1970s, Eastern European and Soviet researchers began to use the term “radio-wave 
sickness” to refer to a clinical syndrome in those occupationally exposed to EM fields, 
particularly RF fields. The symptoms they listed for radio-wave sickness include headache, 
increased fatigability, increased irritability, dizziness, loss of appetite, sleepiness, difficulties in 
concentration or memory, depression, emotional instability, and rashes. 

A growing number of people around the world are reporting symptoms characteristic of 
radio-wave sickness. I myself suffered from symptoms that I ascribe to radio-wave sickness 
when, for a period of eight months beginning in mid-2012, I lived in a house fitted with a 
smart meter. (Smart meters, which have been introduced as a replacement to analogue 
electricity meters, emit brief, sharp pulses of RF radiation.) Radio-wave sickness can be 
extremely debilitating—so much so that it’s not uncommon for sufferers to flee from their 
home to an environment with lower levels of EM pollution. 

More debilitating still is electromagnetic hypersensitivity (EHS), a condition which emerged 
during the 1980s and has been increasing rapidly in incidence ever since. Those afflicted 
with EHS find they become ill when exposed to virtually any form of artificial EM radiation, 
whether it’s from a cellphone, a washing machine, or power lines. Symptoms of EHS include 
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fatigue, anxiety, concentration and memory difficulties, digestive disturbances, ringing in the 
ears, and dermatological issues such as redness, tingling, and burning. More and more 
evidence is accumulating to suggest that EHS involves a response on the part of the immune 
system in a similar manner to that of a conventional allergic reaction. 

If indeed we humans are sensitive to both natural and artificial EM fields, to what do we owe 
such sensitivity? There is strong evidence for the existence of particles of magnetite in both 
human brain tissue and in bones from the region of the sphenoid/ethmoid sinus complex. 
What makes this evidence significant is that numerous living things endowed with 
magnetoception—the ability to detect a magnetic field to perceive direction, altitude, or 
location—contain magnetite crystals in their bodies. 

In addition to being a celebrated ability of homing pigeons, magnetoception has been 
observed in turtles, mice, mole rats, bats, fruit flies, honey bees, and even bacteria. A series of 
experiments conducted throughout the 1970s by a British biologist named Robin Baker, one 
of which involved taking blindfolded schoolchildren on bus trips throughout the countryside 
and asking them to point in the direction of “home” once the bus had reached its 
destination, showed that humans most likely possess a magnetic sense of direction like that 
of other animals, albeit one that operates on a subconscious level and is relatively weak. 

Although magnetoception could hardly be classified as a paranormal faculty, there are an 
abundance of instances whereby the paranormal and electromagnetism intersect. Many 
alleged psychics, including the British healer Matthew Manning and the Israeli-born spoon 
bender Uri Geller, suffered at a young age a severe electric shock from mains electricity. The 
development of psychic abilities is a claim also common among lightning strike survivors. 
Many survivors further claim that electrical devices go haywire whenever they touch or go 
near them, and that their bodies have an unusual tendency to become highly charged with 
static electricity. 

The buildup of static on the body and the experience of making electrical devices go haywire 
for no apparent reason are both key symptoms of a condition called high voltage syndrome 
(HVS). Those afflicted with HVS are termed “electric people.” Besides lightning strike and 
electric shock as initiators of HVS, the condition can arise after suffering an emotional crisis 
or as a side effect of severe illness. In 1920, thirty-four convicts at Clinton Prison, 
Dannemora, New York, developed what was described as “peculiar static electric power” 
after becoming ill with botulism poisoning. Oddly, the patients remained statically charged 
even when immersed in water. As the health of the patients improved, their static abilities 
vanished. 
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A fifty-year-old electric person from New Zealand’s Kapiti Coast, named Kate R, mentioned 
to me in an email that streetlamps “go on and off” when she approaches them, a 
phenomenon known as streetlamp interference (SLI). She added: 

“[R]adios turn to static if I am close to them, watches go backwards on me and digital 
watches only last a few days before the battery is drained. A compass is useless to me because 
it either just keeps spinning or it insists that true north is wherever I am. If I am really 
stressed I cause things to blow up—light bulbs either blow or explode out of their sockets. 
My kids won’t let me touch anything electrical if I’m stressed because I have blown up 2 
televisions, 2 fridges, a cake mixer, a vacuum cleaner and more light bulbs than I can count.” 

The phenomena claimed by Kate and other electric people are similar to those reported in 
connection with poltergeist agents. A poltergeist agent is someone around whom poltergeist 
disturbances occur. Such disturbances typically involve objects being thrown about and 
banging and rapping sounds but can also take the form of electrical devices malfunctioning 
for no apparent reason. Most parapsychologists view poltergeist phenomena as instances of 
recurrent spontaneous psychokinesis (RSPK), which is equivalent to saying that the 
subconscious mind of the agent is responsible. 

The message is clear: by continuing to pollute and thereby alter our EM environment, we are 
also altering ourselves. In particular, these changes infringe on the psychic side of our being. 


